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Lecture Capture Solution - Impartus:

Paperless Digital Exams - E Pad

A Path-Braking Eco-Friendly initiative at Manipal 
University

Manipal Academy of Higher Education (MAHE) has been 
at the forefront of using innovative technology solutions, to 
enhance the student's learning experience and to promote 
an eco-friendly lifestyle in the campus.

Starting September 2016, MAHE has adopted a 
revolutionary and eco-friendly way of conducting all 
internal and end-semester examinations, in a paperless, 
digital manner, in all it's Institutions.

Students will be able to answer their descriptive questions, 
on a custom-built examination device, just like writing on 
paper, while at the same time, have access to a wide range 
of tools, to make their answer scripts look neat and 
colourful. The digital answer script also brings about a high 
level of security and transparency to the entire exam 
process, even allowing the student to view their evaluated 
answer scripts, online, after declaration of results.

SLCM (Student life cycle management)

PRAISE (Policy on publication and research award 

incentive for students to excel)

Attendance and Internal Assessment

18

Promotion to Second  Year MBBS Course

Supplementary Examination

Calculation of Internal Assessment marks:

19

* Elective Posting

Department Period

Internship

No student will be permitted to do Internship training 
outside India (As per NMC Guidelines)

Code of Student Conduct

Introduction and purpose

Definitions

1. Student expectations: Students will 



Lecture Capture Solution - Impartus:

A Path-Braking Eco-Friendly initiative at Manipal 
University

Manipal Academy of Higher Education (MAHE) has been 
at the forefront of using innovative technology solutions, to 
enhance the student's learning experience and to promote 
an eco-friendly lifestyle in the campus.

PRAISE (Policy on publication and research award 

incentive for students to excel)

Students will be able to answer their descriptive questions, 
on a custom-built examination device, just like writing on 
paper, while at the same time, have access to a wide range 
of tools, to make their answer scripts look neat and 
colourful. The digital answer script also brings about a high 
level of security and transparency to the entire exam 
process, even allowing the student to view their evaluated 
answer scripts, online, after declaration of results.

Starting September 2016, MAHE has adopted a 
revolutionary and eco-friendly way of conducting all 
internal and end-semester examinations, in a paperless, 
digital manner, in all it's Institutions.

Paperless Digital Exams - E Pad

SLCM (Student life cycle management)

Attendance and Internal Assessment

18

Supplementary Examination

Calculation of Internal Assessment marks:

Promotion to Second  Year MBBS Course

19

* Elective Posting

Department Period

Internship

No student will be permitted to do Internship training 
outside India (As per NMC Guidelines)

Code of Student Conduct

Introduction and purpose

Definitions

1. Student expectations: Students will 



20

2. Attendance and Preparation for Class

5. Graffiti / Vandalism (property and /or equipment)

Do not disturb conduct of classes

4. Conduct during Examination

Do not eat, drink or chew gum in class.

Do not come late to class.

3. Classroom Etiquette

Boys

6. Dress Code

Girls

Prohibited for boys

Prohibited for girls

21

7. Weapons or Replicas of Weapons

8. Illegal Drugs and Alcohol (possession\ 

personal use\ providing for others)

9. Smoking

11. Fighting / Criminal Assault

10. Risky Behaviour

12. Respect for Authority

14. Bullying\Intimidation\Swarming

13. Harassment\Threatening

15. Ragging
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Dr. Vinutha R Bhat

Dr. Shobha U Kamath

Dr. Prabhudeva Mane

7.

8.

9.

6.

Police Inspector
10.

Anti-Ragging Committee

Dr. Geetha M

Dr. Chiranjay Mukhopadhyay

1.

2.

3.

The following is the composition of Anti-Ragging Committee

Dr. Sharath K Rao

Sl.No Name, Designation and Address Telephone No. Email ID

Dr. Anil Bhat

4.

Dr. Krishnananda  Prabhu

5.

22

Penalty for Ragging: 

Directorate of Student Affairs, 

Manipal Academy of Higher 

Education

The Anti-Ragging squad, comprising of the 

following members, is also constituted.

Director, Student Affairs

Student support centre (SSC)

Deputy Director, Student Affairs - Health Sciences 

Deputy Director, Student Affairs - Technical

23
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SSC offers the following services to its students –

Objectives of the Student Support Centre: – SEARCH - The Health
Sciences Library
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Manipal Conventus

Mist

Verve and Vibes

Objectives

Volunteer Services

Organization (VSO)
Mr Deepak Bairy
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Physical Education 
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Relaxation time. Places to visit

Fuel up…. Petrol bunks

Random stuff

Oh we almost forgot.

 Its all about money honey… Money Exchange

National and International Transport

32

NICE TO KNOW

Nice to follow outside class:

You have got mail!

You wanna buy something...?

Oh its so Hot….Oh its Raining ….. Climate

Tring Tring. ...
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